
PRIVACY POLICY 

1. The controller 

Surfing on the web site www.sleuresis.it (“Web Site”) and sending an e-mail trough the link 
“Contact” or to one of the e-mail addresses indicated on the Web Site, personal data relating 
to an identified or identifiable natural person may be processed (“Processing”). 

This document indicates to the users how personal data are processed and such information 
constitutes an information notice according to Article 13 of the EU Regulation no. 679/2016 
on the protection of natural persons, with regard to the processing of personal data and on 
the free movement of such data (“Regulation”). 

The controller is Lawyer Mr. Marco Venturello, who is also the owner of the law firm 
“VENTURELLO E BOTTARINI, AVVOCATI” (“Law Firm”), with headquarter in Turin, 
Via Vittorio Amedeo II no. 17. 

2. Processed data 

2.1 Browsing data 

The information systems and software procedures relied upon to operate this Web Site 
acquire personal data as part of their standard functioning; the transmission of such data is 
an inherent feature of Internet communication protocols. Such information are not collected 
in order to relate it to identified data subjects, however it might allow user identification per 
se after being processed. 

This data category includes IP addresses and/or the domain names of the computers used by 
any user connecting with this Web Site, the URI (Uniform Resource Identifier) addresses of 
the requested resources, the time of such requests, the method used for submitting a given 
request to the server, returned file size, a numerical code relating to server response status 
(successfully performed, error, etc.), and other parameters related to the user's operating 
system and computer environment. 

The Web Site neither processes nor stores such data. 

2.2 Cookie 

In order to have information about the Processing of personal data through cookies, please 
take note of the relative policy, available at the following link. 

2.3 Data provided voluntarily by users 

Sending e-mail messages to the addresses mentioned on this Web Site, which is done on the 
basis of a freely chosen, explicit, and voluntary option, entails acquisition of the sender's 
address, which is necessary in order to reply to any request, as well as of such additional 
personal data indicated voluntarily by the sender in the message. 

3. Type of data collected and the consequences of any refusal to give data  

Except for the specifications made with regard to navigation data, which are necessary in 
order to allow the correct use of the Web Site, and with regard to cookies, users are free to 
provide the personal data to ask for a reply to a request sent to the lawyers. 

http://www.sleuresis.it/
https://www.sleuresis.it/cookie/informativa_cookie_eng.pdf


Therefore, failure to provide such data may entail the failure to be provided with what was 
requested. 

4. Processing arrangement and time of processing 

The personal data could be processed using manual, computerised and automated systems 
for such period of time as is necessary in order to achieve the purpose for which the data are 
collected. 

The controller adopts specific security measures in order to ensure that the Processing will 
be in compliance with the Regulation’s rules, with particular attention to the prevention of 
loss of data, unlawful or incorrect use or unauthorised access to such data. 

5. Data subject’s rights 

At any time, the data subject shall have the right to obtain from the controller confirmation 
as to whether or not personal data concerning him or her are being processed (the 
Processing), and, where that is the case, the right to know: the purposes of the processing; 
the categories of personal data concerned; the recipients or categories of recipient to whom 
the personal data have been or will be disclosed; where possible, the envisaged period for 
which the personal data will be stored, or, if not possible, the criteria used to determine that 
period; the existence of the right to obtain rectification or erasure of personal data or 
restriction of processing of personal data concerning the data subject or to object to such 
processing; the right to lodge a complaint with a supervisory authority (Article 15 
Regulation). The data subject has also the right to receive the personal data concerning him 
or her, in a structured, commonly used and machine-readable format (Article 20 
Regulation). 

In order to exercise such rights, the data subjects can write to the controller, lawyer Mr. 
Marco Venturello, sending an e-mail to the following address: segreteria@sleuresis.it. 

The personal data may be processed by other subjects, appointed by the controller in 
accordance with Article 28 and 29 of the Regulation. The list of such subjects is available at 
the seat of the Law Firm “VENTURELLO E BOTTARINI, AVVOCATI”. 

6. Communication of personal data 

The personal data collected on the Web Site shall not be communicated or disseminated to 
third parties, except for the communication and the dissemination of the data as requested, 
pursuant to law, by police, judicial authorities, intelligence and security agencies and other 
public bodies, for purposes of defence or relating to State security, or for the prevention, 
detection or suppression of offences. 

 

mailto:segreteria@sleuresis.it

